

BID #20-10 HARDWARE & PAINT DESCRIPTION	Aboff's Paints	Pioneer Manufacturing	Sherwin Williams	Walsh&Hughes Velvetop
PART 'A' BUILDING HARDWARE:				
Entire Building HARDWARE Line Price List:	No Bid	No Bid	Floor & Ceiling Tiles, Cove Base, InPro Wall Protection	No Bid
Percent Discount Off List or Retail Less-	NB	NB	Less -30%	NB
Percent Wholesale MarkUp Plus+	NB	NB	NB	NB
PART 'B' PAINT MANUFACTURER LINE:				
Name of Paint Manufacturer or Price List:	Benjamin Moore, 2/01/2019	No Bid	Sherwin Williams, 01/2020	No Bid
Percent Discount Off List or Retail Less-	Less -50%	No Bid	Less -55%	
Name of Paint Manufacturer or Price List:	Abboff's Paint, 02/01/2019	No Bid	PaintShield Microbicial	No Bid
Percent Discount Off List or Retail Less-	Less -25%		Less -40%	
SUNDRIES & PAINT SUPPLIES:				
Percent Discount Off List or Retail Less-	No Bid	No Bid	In-Stock Supplies Less -30%	No Bid
Percent Wholesale MarkUp Plus+	NB	NB	NB	NB
Exceptions (if any):				
Field & Paint Line STRIPING EQUIPMENT:				
Graco Paint FieldLazer S200 Walk-behind Striper, Model #24M609	No Bid	\$3850.00 #24M609	\$4200.00 #1012-94742	\$3,875.00
JayPro DryLine FieldMarker Walk-behind Striper, Model #FLMR100HD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Titan Paint Line Striper PowrLiner Walk-behind Striper, Model #6950	No Bid	No Bid	\$8100.00 #1005-56208	No Bid
Striping Equipment PARTS: Percent Discount Off List or MarkUp from Wholesale	No Bid	No Bid	Less -40%	
PART 'C' TRAFFIC & FIELD MARKING PAINT:				
FIELD Marking Paint, VOC, BM#165-90, White, (5) gallon	\$35.25/ 5gal. INSLX FM6501	33.97/ 5gal. Pioneer ATHW5PM	36.25/ 5gal. SW Sherstripe 6500-45495	39.00/ 5gal. Franklin 2205 Half Time
FIELD Marking Paint, VOC, Yellow, (5) gallon pail	\$40.25/ 5gal. INSLX FM10510	33.97/ 5gal. Pioneer ATHY5PM	65.25/ 5gal. SW Sherstripe 6500-45453	48.00/ 5gal. Franklin 2206 Half Time
Latex Traffic, Ben.Moore #65-10, White, (5) gallon pail	\$51.50/ 5gal. INSLX TP2210	No Bid	50.16/ 5gal. Hotline TM2320 #8000-53811	72.00/ 5gal. Franklin 2014 Hydrophast
Latex Traffic, Ben.Moore #58-10, Yellow, (5) gallon pail	\$53.50/ 5gal. INSLX TP3224	No Bid	50.16/ 5gal. Hotline TM2321 #8000-53795	72.00/ 5gal. Franklin 2015 Hydrophast
Latex Traffic, Ben.Moore #58-80, Blue, (5) gallon pail	\$52.50/ 5gal. INSLX TP2242	No Bid	72.83/ 5gal. Setfast TM2133 #6401-14641	68.00/ 5gal. Franklin 2024 Hydrophast
Latex Traffic, Red, (1) gallon pail	\$22.00/ 1gal. INSLX TP2202	No Bid	17.14/ 1gal. Propark #6503-27216	No Bid
Alkyd Modified Gloss Enamel Ext. Paint, Ben.Moore #Z22, Green, (1) gallon pail (for use on fences)	\$25.00/ 1gal. INSL-X	No Bid	37.55/ 1gal. Metalastic DTM B55TZ604	No Bid
Upside-Down Traffic Spray Paint, Yellow, 6-18oz.cans/case	No Bid	No Bid	32.16/ 6 per case 18oz. Sherliner 160-0006	49.95/ 12 per case 18oz. Durastripe
Upside-Down FIELD Line Marking Spray Paint, (6)cans/case, Any Color (for field line striping machine)	No Bid	23.50/6/cs. 18oz. Pioneer Quik Stripe	20.70/ 6 per case 17oz. Sherstripe #6500-77589	49.95/ 12 per case 18oz. Durastripe
Spray Paint, decorator, Krylon, Any Color, (12) oz. can	\$3.99/12oz. Krylon	No Bid	\$3.75/12oz. #1017-16017	No Bid
Spray Paint, Rust-Oleum, top coat, Any Color, (12) oz. can	\$3.99/12oz. RustOleum	No Bid	\$5.98/12oz. Krylon topcoat	No Bid
Paint, top coat, Rust-Oleum, Any Color, (1) Pint can	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Paint, top coat, Rust-Oleum, Any Color, (1) quart can	\$11.99/quart RustOleum	No Bid	\$14.77/quart SW All Surface	No Bid
Awarded Items:	Ben Moore & Aboffs Paint, Spray Paint, Green paint & Blue Traffic Paint, Rustoleum Paint	Pioneer White & Yellow field paint, Striping Equip.	Sher.Williams paint, Sundries,Hardware Line, White,Red & Yel. Traffic, upside-down field spray paint, Striping Equip. & Parts	Traffic yellow marking upside-down Paint