

BID #20-20 PRINT & DELIVER - JUNIOR & SENIOR HIGH ITEMS		7/1/20 - 6/30/21			
DESCRIPTION	Bidder:	RYDIN DECAL	SAV-ON PRINTING	SCHOOL PAPER EXPRESS	TOBAY PRINTING
<b>PART "A" PRINT &amp; DELIVER To Schools As Needed:</b>		<b>Est. Qty.</b>			
A-1 "LATE PASS", 5.5"x 4.25" NCR 2-PAGE, 35,000, 15# paper	35,000	No Bid	<u>1,036.00/35,000</u>	No Bid	No Bid
A-2 "GOOD NEWS" POSTCARD, Approx. 10,000 Priced as printed on (2) two sides, 4"x6", 2- color, 100# CIS	per 1000 per 10,000	No Bid	<u>65.00/ 1,000</u> <u>700.00/10,000</u>	No Bid	No Bid
A-3 "Elective Expo" POSTCARD, Approx. 3,000 Priced as printed on (2) two sides, 4-1/4"x 5-1/2", 2- color	per 1000 per 3000	No Bid	<u>92.25/1,000</u> <u>276.75/3,000</u>		
A-4 PARKING HANG-TAG PERMIT, 3"x5"horizontal, Approx. 500	per 100	<u>279.00/100</u> <u>649.00/500</u>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
A-5 PARKING DECAL STICKER, 2"x2", Approx. 600	per 100	<u>213.00/100</u> <u>378.00/600</u>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
A-6 PRESS-ON GRAPH LABELS, 6 labels/pg., Approx. 1,800	per 100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
A-7 SUBSTITUTE TEACHER FOLDER, letter size Approx. 1,000 <b>Option:</b> With inside pocket on right side, white stock 12pt. w/pocket	per 1,000	No Bid	<u>475.00/1,000</u> <u>1,070.00/1,000</u>	No Bid	No Bid
A-8 UNOFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT, 20# PAPER, Approx. 5,000	per 1,000	No Bid	<u>\$50.00/1,000</u> <u>250.00/5,000</u>	No Bid	No Bid
A-9 OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT, 60# Smooth Offset, Approx. 10,000	per 1,000	No Bid	<u>\$40.00/1,000</u> <u>400.00/10,000</u>	No Bid	No Bid
A-10 SENIOR AWARD BANQUET PROGRAM, 8x10 with Cover 80# Color, saddle-stitched, 2-sided printing - DELIVERED	per 200	No Bid	<u>500.00/200</u> 5 day delivery	No Bid	No Bid
A-11 SHS NEWSPAPER, SIX ISSUES/PER YEAR 8-Page - Cost per issue delivered, 2,700 on Newsprint 12-Page - Cost per issue delivered, 2,700 on Newsprint Total for Both 8-page issue & 12-page issue: Turn around Time:	2,700 2,700	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	<u>\$355.00</u> <u>\$455.00</u> <b>Total 810.00</b> <u>1 day turnaround</u>	* * * *
A-12 JHS NEWSPAPER, FOUR ISSUES/PER YEAR 4-Page - Cost per issue delivered, 1,600, 60# Offset Recycled Newsprint * 100% recycled newsprint as specified Turn around Time:	1,600	No Bid	No Bid	* * *	<b>345.00*</b> Rolland 100% recycled 3 day turaround
<b>PART "B" Senior High JUNE, 2018 Print &amp; Deliver</b> <b>Awarded in Total for Items B-1, B-2, B-3:</b>					
B-1 GRADUATION PROGRAM, 2,600	2,600	No Bid	<u>\$4,375.00</u>	No Bid	No Bid
B-2 GRADUATION ANNOUNCEMENT CARD, 3,000 ENVELOPE, 3,000	3,000 3,000	No Bid No Bid	<u>\$610.00</u> <u>\$180.00</u>	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
B-3 GRADUATION ADMISSION TICKET Color Ticket, 1,500 Color Ticket, 1,500	1,500 1,500	No Bid No Bid	<u>68.00/1500</u> <u>68.00/1500</u>	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Optional Cost of additional tickets per 100 if needed <b>Total for items B-1, B-2, B-3:</b>	per 100	No Bid	<u>3.00/100</u> <u>\$5,301.00</u>	No Bid	No Bid
DELIVERY CHARGE		None	None	None	None
<b>All "No Award" items Must be price compared as needed.</b>					