

BID #20-21 PRINTING & DELIVERY OF DISTRICT CORRESPONDENCE 7/1/20 - 6/30/21

DESCRIPTION	Bidder:	SAV-ON PRINTING	TOBAY PRINTING
PART "B" PRINT, PACK & DELIVER TO POST OFFICE:			
	<u>Quantity</u>		
B-1 "BUDGET VOTE", SELF MAILER, 11"x17" Folded in half & in quarter to 8.5"x 5.5", sealed with (1) wafer seal, 20# White Offset, per mailing 33,250	33,250	No Bid	<u>1525.00/ mailing</u>
B-2 POSTCARD, 4"x 6", 10pt. CIS, White, 100# uncoated, approx. 10,000	per 1,000	<u>52.70/1,000</u>	*
PART "A" PRINT & DELIVER TO THE SCHOOL DISTRICT:			
A-1 ARCHIVE LABEL, PERFFORATED, SELF STICK, approx.5,000	per 1,000	<u>360.00/1,000</u>	No Bid
A-2 "RECYCLE" LABEL, 6x11, SELF STICK, approx.1,000	per 1,000	<u>335.00/1,000</u>	No Bid
A-3 "BUS SAFETY" BROCHURE, Tri-Folded to #10 (3-panel), 24# Smooth White	per 800	<u>150.00/500</u>	No Bid
A-4 BUSINESS CARDS, 2x3-1/2, 65# LT. GREEN, 2-INK	per 500	<u>60.00/500</u>	No Bid
A-5 LETTERHEAD, 24# ROYAL BOND LT. COCKLE, 2-INK			
1,000 to 3,000 Delivered	per 1,000	<u>108.00/1,000</u>	No Bid
4,000 to 11,000 Delivered	per 1,000	<u>95.00/1,000</u>	No Bid
12,000 and up Delivered	per 1,000	<u>93.00/1,000</u>	No Bid
A-6 REPORT CARD ENVELOPE, 28# BROWN KRAFT, 6x9 OPEN END, PRINTED Black Front & Back, approx 2,500 K-1st & 3,000 3&4th grade	per 5,500	<u>198.00/1,000</u>	No Bid
A-7 **PERMANENT STUDENT RECORD, 8-CARDS/SET, 90#, COLLATE, & SHRINK WRAP IN PACKAGES OF (5) 8-CARD SETS **	3,000 packages	<u>4,079.00/3,000</u>	No Bid
A-8 SPECIAL ENVELOPES, 6"x 9" Booklet with & without Window, White sub 24, split gum flap, corner card with logo/address			
	NO Window per 5000	<u>450.00/5,000*</u>	No Bid
	Window (1-1/8"x 4-1/2" position 1/2" from left & 2-1/4" from bottom) per 5000	<u>788.00/5,000*</u>	No Bid
	* 20% over or under allowed		
A-9 VISITOR PASS STICKER, 3"x 4" roll of 1000, 5 different Neon colors per/roll	1,000/roll	<u>112.00/1,000</u>	No Bid
(5) rolls per school name with each roll in a different neon color	per 5,000	<u>560.00/5,000*</u>	Np Bid
	*5 rolls various colors delivered & printed with one school name		