

# LCSD Bid #20-39 REPAIR OF TWO WAY RADIO EQUIPMENT AS-NEEDED 7/1/2020 - 6/30/2021

<i>Authorized Motorola Dealers:</i>	INTEGRATED WIRELESS		
Labor Rate: <u>At-Shop</u> (Off-Site) Repair	<u>\$90.00/hr. \$45.00/half hr.</u>		
Labor Rate: Programming (if needed)	<u>\$25.00/per Radio</u>		
Labor Rate: <u>On-Site</u> Repair at school district*	<u>\$100.00/hr. \$50.00/half hr.</u>		
Labor Rate: <u>On-Site</u> Troubleshooting of Communication, coding & triangulation *	<u>\$120.00/hr.</u>		
Travel Rate for On-Site Repairs & Pickup/Delivery *	<u>\$50.00/hour \$25.00/half hr.</u>		
<i>Total for On-Site Repair, troubleshoot, travel</i>	<u>\$270.00/hr.</u>		
Price per Vehicle to install radio & antenna supplied by District (plus travel if installed at school district)	<u>\$250.00/vehicle at school \$225.00/vehicle at vendor facility</u>		
Shipping/Delivery (To & From) Cost	<u>\$25.00/per Radio</u>		
Charge for Non-Repairable Equipment (Bench charge)	<u>\$45.00/per Radio</u>		
Estimated Time to Repair Portable Radios	approx. 14 days		
Loaner Repeater or Base Station (install, set-up, remove & reinstall)	<u>\$480.00/per unit</u>		
Loaner Repeater or Base Station Monthly Charge	<u>\$250.00/per month</u>		
<b><u>NEW EQUIPMENT with Programming, cables, shipping:</u></b>			
CP200D UHF 4W/16CH	<u>\$451.00</u>		
SL300 UHF 4W/16CH	<u>\$295.00</u>		
CP185 (analog) UHF 4W/16CH	<u>\$260.00</u>		
XPR3300e UHF 16CH	<u>\$530.00</u>		
CM200D 40W/16CH MOBILE/BASE mixed mode & cables	<u>\$565.00</u>		
XPR5350 (450-512M) 40W MOBILE	<u>\$1,003.00</u>		
SLR5000 REPEATER UHF mixed mode & cables	<u>\$2,985.00</u>		
SLR8000 BASE STATION	<u>\$7,750.00</u>		
UHF DUPLEXER T1500A	<u>\$350.00</u>		
CABLE # PMJN4143A	<u>\$45.00</u>		
REMOTE MOUNT KIT #PMLN6404B	<u>\$90.00</u>		
Any other EQUIPMENT item <u>NOT</u> listed	<u>25% Discount from List</u>		

\* On-site repair, troubleshooting & travel are awarded together.

# LCSD Bid #20-39 REPAIR OF TWO WAY RADIO EQUIPMENT AS-NEEDED 7/1/2020 - 6/30/2021

*Authorized Motorola Dealers:*

**INTEGRATED  
WIRELESS**

**PARTS / ACCESSORIES:**

CLIPS		No Bid		
RSM Microphone		No Bid		
CHARGER 6 multi-unit		No Bid		
IP SITE CONNECTION LICENSE		<u>\$100.00</u>		
Mobile Antenna (450-470UHF)		<u>\$19.00</u>		
Mobile Accessory Kit & Ignition Switch		<u>\$35.00</u>		
Stubby Antenna (HT1000)		<u>\$14.00</u>		
Stubby Antenna (CP200 & CP185)		<u>\$8.00</u>		
Antenna (HT750)		<u>\$8.00</u>		
WHIP Antenna XPR3300e		<u>\$9.50</u>		
CHARGER Single Unit PMPN4174A		<u>\$65.00</u>		
HT1000 NIMH Battery		<u>\$44.00</u>		
HT 750 Battery		<u>\$39.00</u>		
LI ION 3000mAh IP69 BATTERY		No Bid		
CP200 LI ION Battery 2250MAH		<u>\$55.00</u>		
CP185 LI ION Battery 1750T		<u>\$45.00</u>		
Any other ACCESSORY item <u>NOT</u> listed		<u>25% Discount from List</u>		
Bidder is authorized dealer using the Motorola list price with a repair parts cost not to exceed \$100.00 per unit.				Page 2 of 2