

LONGWOOD PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES EQUIPMENT

JULY 1, 2020 - SEPT. 5, 2020

ITEM #	ITEM SUBSTITUTION	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY.	FREESTYLE PHOTOGRAPHIC		
				UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL COST
18686	QUANTITY CHANGE	EDU ULTRA VC RC SM 8X10/250 ARISTA	15	Ea	\$159.99	\$2,399.85
18656	QUANTITY CHANGE	EDU ULTRAC VC RC SM 5X7/250 ARISTA	40	Ea	\$84.99	\$3,399.60
186113		EDUULTRA VC RC SM 11X14/25 ARISTA	1	Ea	\$38.99	\$38.99
19284	NO BID	EDO ULTRA FB VC FG SM 8X10/100 ARISTA FINE GRAIN MATTE	2	Ea	NO BID	
531851	QUANTITY CHANGE	ARISTA ORTHO 3.0 8.5X11/100 ORTHO LITHO FILM 4 MIL	1	Ea	\$139.99	\$139.99
145406	QUANTITY CHANGE	LEGACYPRO LIQUID PAPER DEV MAKES 2.5 GALLON POLYMAX T	25	Ea	\$9.99	\$249.75
5050851		KODAK TMAX LQD DEV MAKES 5L, B&W CHEMISTRY 5 LITERS	10	Ea	\$19.99	\$199.90
1231296		ECOPRO NEUTRAL RAPID FIX 1 GAL LEGACYPRO ECO PRO FIXER	15	Ea	\$29.99	\$449.85
1831620		ROCKLAND PRINTINT MAKES 1 GAL	1	Ea	\$29.95	\$29.95
1231333	QUANTITY CHANGE	ECOPRO CLEAR STOP BATH 1 GAL ECO PRO ODORLESS	1	Ea	\$38.99	\$38.99
762617	QUANTITY CHANGE	ILFORD MG UNDER LENS FILTER SET MOUNTED FILTERS	1	Ea	\$109.99	\$109.99
190244	QUANTITY CHANGE	EDU ULTRA 400 ISO 35X24 B&W FILM	1300	Ea	\$4.49	\$5,837.00
137666	NO BID	ILFORD MG FILTER SET 6X6 SET OF 12 MULTIGRADE FILTERS	4	Ea	NO BID	
33205	QUANTITY CHANGE	Drytac trimount dry mount tissue, 8x10 / 100 sheets	1	Ea	\$42.99	\$42.99
97492	QUANTITY CHANGE	HALCO 15A/W WHITE SAFELIGHT BULB 130V A 15FR15 6014	1	Ea	\$1.99	\$1.99
194369		ARISTA BAMBOO TONGS SET OF 3 WITH RUBBER TIPS	1	Ea	\$6.99	\$6.99
39086	QUANTITY CHANGE	ARISTA II INKJET 8.5X11/250 LU PHOTOGRADE LUSTRE INSTANT DRY	3	Ea	\$84.99	\$254.97
390115	QUANTITY CHANGE	ARISTA II INKJET 11X17/50 LU PHOTOGRADE LUSTRE INSTANT DRY	1	Ea.	\$43.99	\$43.99
19402	19402125/QUANTITY CHANGE	ARISTA BLACK & WHITE 11X14/25 MAT BOARD	10	Ea	\$36.75	\$367.50
19404	19404625/QUANTITY CHANGE	ARISTA BALCK & WHITE 16X20/25 MAT BOARD	4	Ea	\$61.80	\$247.20
2214	QUANTITY CHANGE	PEC PAD 4"X4" SHEETS/100 PACK	5	ea	\$8.95	\$44.75
51504	QUANTITY CHANGE	EDWAL FILM CLEANER 4OZ.	4	Ea	\$26.99	\$107.96
232032	QUANTITY CHANGE	BERG TONER BLUE, 8OZ.	3	Ea	\$12.99	\$38.97
232042	QUANTITY CHANGE	BERG TONER BROWN/COPPER 8OZ.	8	Ea	\$12.99	\$103.92
357100	QUANTITY CHANGE	PRINTFILE 35-7 STRIP 5 NEG 100 NEGATIVE SLEEVE 100 PACK	6	Ea	\$17.19	\$103.14
2343220	QUANTITY CHANGE	PH140 EIKO/WIKO BULB 75W	6	Ea	\$7.99	\$47.94
5415120	QUANTITY CHANGE	EDWAL NO SCRATCH 1OZ.	2	Ea	\$23.99	\$47.98
109583	203547/QUANTITY CHANGE	ILFORD ANTI STATIC CLOTH 13X13 ANTISTATICUM	12	Ea	\$11.90	\$142.80
55114	33210/QUANTITY CHANGE	TRIMOUNT DRYTAC dry mount tissue, 11x14 - 100 sheets	1	Ea	\$65.99	\$65.99
Page 1 of 2		*****QUOTE VALID UNTIL 09/05/2020*****				

ITEM #	ITEM SUBSTITUTION	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR:	FREESTYLE PHOTOGRAPHIC		
			QTY.	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL COST
192113	QUANTITY CHANGE	EDU ULTRA FB VC 11X14/ 25 ARISTA FINE GRAIN MATTE	4	Ea	\$51.99	\$207.96
1464510	NO BID	KODAK PHOTO FLO 200 16OZ. WETTING AGENT	1	Ea	NO BID	
13633016	NO BID	CANVAS 450 GSM 8.5X11/30 HARMAN BY HAHNEMUHLE	1	Ea	NO BID	
10641211	NO BID	DAGUERRE CANVAS 1.7X16.5/20 HAHNEMUHLE FINE ART 400 GSM A3	1	Ea	NO BID	
2222	NO BID	PEC 12 FILM CLEANER 2 OZ. LIQUID	1	Ea	NO BID	
9962	NO BID	BLOW OFF 152A AIR DUSTER 10 OZ ORM-DIFLUOROETHANE UN 1030	1	Ea	NO BID	
1402767	NO BID	KODAK TMAX LQD DEV MAKES 1 GAL B&W	1	Ea	NO BID	
3525410	NO BID	LENS CLEANING TISSUE	1	Ea	NO BID	
746702	NO BID	LEGACYPRO SEPIA TONER MAKES 1 QT UN1849 SODIUM SULFIDE HYDRATED	1	Ea	NO BID	
11280	QUANTITY CHANGE	DELTA DATATAINER 1 GAL CHEMICAL STORAGE BOTTLE	6	Ea	\$8.99	\$53.94
1831	NO BID	ARISTA RELOADABLE CARTRIDGE, PACK OF 25	1	PACK	NO BID	
137666	NO BID	ILFORD MULTIGRADE FILTER SET 6X6	1	Ea	NO BID	
SUBSTITUTED ITEM	4007085	ARISTA II PH ART CVM 8.5X11/20 17 MIL MATTE PHOTO ART CANVAS	1	Ea	\$14.99	\$14.99
SUBSTITUTED ITEM	6208	VARTA V13GA ALKALINE BATT A76 REPLACES KODAK LR44	20	Ea	\$2.49	\$49.80
SUBSTITUTED ITEM	140052	PATERSON AGITATOR 2-PACK FOR SINGLE & DOUBLE TANKS	2	Ea	\$6.99	\$13.98
SUBSTITUTED ITEM	1760	PATERSON RED DOME SAFELIGHT A-DOME DARKROOM LIGHT	1	Ea	\$46.99	\$46.99
SUBSTITUTED ITEM	6195121	ARISTA FILM SQUEEGEE 4.7 INCH	1	Ea	\$13.99	\$13.99
SUBSTITUTED ITEM	1216	PREMIER PAPER SAFE 12X16	1	Ea	\$74.99	\$74.99
SUBSTITUTED ITEM	5042	ARISTA PREM SINGLE REEL TANK W/ONE ADJUSTABLE REEL	2	Ea	\$25.99	\$51.98
Page 2 of 2		*****QUOTE VALID UNTIL 09/05/2020*****				