

RFQ #005-20 AGENDAS, PLANNERS & FOLDERS FOR 2020-21

BIDDER:

Senior High 5"x 8"

Size:
850 Student Planner w/6 schl.pg.
25 Teacher Edition
Custom Cover
Add'l Charges&/or Delivery
Add'l. 4-double-sided page set
Add'l Add-On Supplement sections

Junior High 8.5"x11"

Size:
1,900 Student Planner w/20 schl.pg.
25 Teacher Edition
Custom Cover
Add'l Charges &/or Delivery
Add'l. 2-double-sided pg. set
Hallway Pass Section, index stock 2 pages/2-sided
Vinyl Pouch Page

Middle School 7"x10"or 8.5"x11"

Size:
Total 1,800 Student Planner w/12 schl.pg.
Custom front Cover (we provide art or photo)
Vinyl Pouch
Add'l Charges &/or Delivery
Add'l. 2-double-sided pg. set
No Teacher Editions required
Fifth grade & Sixth grade planners the same

Physical Ed. Calendar Planner

(60) Monthly View 7x10
Add'l. charges

Districtwide:

Homework Laminated Folders

1,650 Middle School-homework

Student Writing Folders 9-1/2"x 11-3/4"

1,650 Elementary Schools (Districtwide)

Add'l. charges &/or delivery

Substitute Teacher Folders 9-5/8"x 11-3/4"

100 folders with pockets, 16# stock
Add'l. charges &/or delivery

SCHOOL DATEBOOK

"Steamboat"
5.5" x 8.5"
1.76 each*
same book*
included
None
0.06/ 8-pg.increment
0.06/ 8-pg./section set

School Datebook
8.5" x 11"
2.61 each
same book
included
None
0.12/ 8-pg. increment
0.10 per agenda book
0.15 ea. Vinyl Pouch

"Telluride"
6.625" x 9"
2.19 each*
included
0.15 ea.
None
0.12/ 8-pg.increment

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

GLOBAL DATEBOOKS

Global Datebook
5.5" x 8.5"
1.95 each*
1.95 each*
included
None
0.07/ 8-pg.increment
0.25 each section

Global Datebook
8.5" x 11"
2.50 each*
2.50 each*
included
None
0.09/ 8-pg. increment
0.11 per agenda book
0.30 ea. Vinyl Pouch

Global Datebook
7" x 9"
2.02 each*
included
0.30 ea.
None
0.09/ 8-pg. increment

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

****NO AWARD****

****NO AWARD****

****NO AWARD****

****NO AWARD****

** Style and/or size, reference sections, hall passes, teacher edition or number of weeks included in planner do not meet the specific needs of the school or department.,*

****ITEMS NOT AWARDED MUST BE PRICE-COMPARED IF NEEDED****